
India's Varied Wildlife - Tigers, Leopards & Lions
https://www.tsiholidays.com/package/package-itinerary/indiasvariedwildlife-tigersleopardslions-65hroghqxd

Day 1

DAY 1 II ARRIVE DELHI II FLIGHT

Arrive Delhi and met at airport by representative who will assist with luggage and escort you to car and
transfer to hotel. Overnight at hotel.

Day 2

DAY 2 II DELHI

After breakfast proceed for full day tour of Delhi covering Red Fort (from outside), Jama Masjid, Rajghat,
India Gate, President House & Gurudwara Bangla Sahib (Sikh Temple), Humayun’s Tomb & Qutub Minar.
Overnight at hotel.

Day 3

DAY 3 II DELHI – AGRA II 203 KMS/3 HRS

After breakfast, check out and drive to Agra. Later half day tour of Agra covering Taj Mahal & Agra Fort.
Overnight at hotel.

Day 4

DAY 4 II AGRA – FATEHPUR SIKRI – BHARATPUR II 56 KMS/1 HR

After breakfast, checkout and drive to Bharatpur enroute visit Fatehpur Sikri. Keoladeo National Park,
popularly known as Bharatpur Bird Sanctuary and recognized as one of the world’s most important bird
breeding and feeding grounds. It is a haven for bird lovers as its home to a wide variety of indigenous &
migratory water birds. Around 370 species of birds inhabit the park, besides various mammals like deer &
Nilgai, and reptiles like the basking python. Overnight at hotel.

Day 5

DAY 5 II BAHARTPUR – RANTHAMBORE II 187 KMS/4 HRS

After breakfast checkout and drive to Ranthambhore enroute visit Chand Baori Step Well (Abhaneri);
Ranthambore offers some of the finest opportunities for sighting the magnificent tiger in the wild. Apart from
the tiger, you can also spot sloth bear, leopard, caracal, jackal, fox, hyena and mongoose. The elusive Indian
wolf too, has been spotted here occasionally. Overnight at hotel.



Day 6

DAY 6 II RANTHAMBORE

Today enjoy morning and evening safaris at Ranthambore National Park. Overnight at hotel.  

Day 7

DAY 7 II RANTHAMBORE – JAIPUR II 152 KMS/3 HRS

After breakfast check out and drive to Jaipur, upon arrival check in to hotel. Overnight at hotel.

Day 8

DAY 8 II JAIPUR

After breakfast proceed for full day tour to Jaipur covering Amer Fort stopover at Hawa Mahal (from outside
only), Gaitor (Cenotaphs), picture stop at Jal Mahal then visit City Palace, Astronomical Observatory.
Overnight at hotel.

Day 9

DAY 9 II JAIPUR – JODHPUR II 334 KMS/5.5 HRS

After breakfast check out and drive to Jodhpur, upon arrival check in to hotel. Overnight at hotel.

Day 10

DAY 10 II JODHPUR – NARLAI II 120 KMS/2.5 HRS

After breakfast proceed for half day tour to Jodhpur covering Mehrangarh fort & Jaswant Thada. Depart for
Narlai, evening free at leisure. Overnight at hotel.

Day 11

DAY 11 II NARLAI

Proceed for morning Leopard sighting safari. Return to hotel for breakfast. Later in the evening take an
escorted village walk, meet the friendly people of the village, their homes and get to learn a little about their
way of life. Overnight at hotel.

Day 12

DAY 12 II NARLAI – RANAKPUR – UDAIPUR II 130 KMS/2.5 HRS



After breakfast check out and drive to Udaipur. Enroute visit to Ranakpur Jain Temple (Ranakpur temple
opens for tourist at 1200hours). Overnight at hotel.

Day 13

DAY 13 II UDAIPUR

After breakfast proceed for half day tour of Udaipur covering Jagdish Temple, City palace and Museums,
Garden of the Maidens. Overnight at hotel.  

Day 14

DAY 14 II UDAIPUR – RAJKOT – SASAN GIR II FLIGHT & 165 KMS/4 HRS

After breakfast check out and transfer to airport to board flight to Rajkot. Upon arrival drive to Sasan Gir,
enroute visiting Naulakha Palace at Gondal and the Darbar Hall Museum at Junagarh. Drive to Sasan Gir.
The Sasan Gir National Park is the only natural habitat of world popular Asiatic Lions. This tour will give
you an unparalleled opportunity to watch those rare Asiatic Lions coupled with thousands of other elusive
wild animals and hard-to-find birds like uncommon Asiatic wild ass, hyenas, Gir foxes, pygmy woodpecker,
brown fish owl and black buck etc. Overnight at hotel.

Day 15

DAY 15 II SASAN GIR NATIONAL PARK

Morning proceed for Jungle Safari, a unique lifetime wildlife experience with its panoramic view & a vast
number of lions. After breakfast time free for own activities. Overnight at hotel.

Day 16

DAY 16 II SASAN GIR NATIONAL PARK – RAJKOT – MUMBAI II 165 KMS/4
HRS & FLIGHT

Get ready for another jungle safari experience in the morning. After breakfast drive to Rajkot airport to board
flight to Mumbai. Overnight at hotel.  

Day 17

DAY 17 II MUMBAI

After breakfast proceed for an excursion to Elephanta Caves. Later visit Gateway of India, Prince of Wales
Museum, Marine drive, Chhatrapati Shivaji Terminus Train Station, Crawford Market, Dhobi Ghat &
Mahatma Gandhi's residence. Overnight at hotel.  

Day 18



DAY 18 II MUMBAI – NAGPUR – TADOBA II FLIGHT & 142 KMS/3 HRS

After breakfast check out and transfer to airport to board flight to Nagpur. Upon arrival drive to Tadoba
National Park. Tadoba National Park showcases an excellent variety of wildlife. This large park is a treasure
quest of wildlife and flora; a place where one can experience the best of nature and its gorgeous creations.
Wildlife like tigers, panthers, wild boars and much more have found a home in this national park. Overnight
at hotel.

Day 19

DAY 19 II TADOBA NATIONAL PARK

Morning & Evening jeep safari with naturalist. Overnight at hotel.

Day 20

DAY 20 II TADOBA NATIONAL PARK – NAGPUR – MUMBAI II 142 KMS/3 HRS
& FLIGHT

After breakfast check out and drive to Nagpur airport to board flight to Mumbai to connect flight back home.


